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A P A S T W H I C H W I L L N O T P A S S I N T O O B L I V I O N -
S U R R O G A T E F O R A F U T U R E 

W H I C H W I L L N O T C O M E ? 

Whdzimierz Borodziej 

How to cope with 45 years of the most recent past is one of the key topics in public 
discussions, in Poland just as elsewhere. The history of the People's Republic of 
Poland is being rewritten, partly with reversed premises. At the same time it is evident 
that a simple reversion of the pre-1989 value systém meets with considerable Opposi-
tion. One of the reasons is the fact that this entails casting doubt on millions of indivi-
dual biographies. The reappraisal of the years 1945-1989 goes along with a revision of 
the stereotypes of Germany which have hitherto been preeminent. The discussion is 
underway in this regard as well, but it is becoming apparent that the pre-1945 history 
is causing much less emotions than what is generally understood by the term "con-
temporary history", which takes the end of the Second World War as its starting 
point. In the latter period, Poland's neighbour to the east plays a far greater part than 
the one to the west. 

H O W T O S E E T H E P A S T W A S D E C R E E D F R O M A B O V E : 
N A Z I S M A N D T H E N O T I O N O F A N A N T I - F A S C I S T 

T R A D I T I O N I N T H E G D R 

Christiane Brenner 

This contribution deals with the role the National-Socialist period played in the way 
the GDR officially saw itself and its past. Anti-fascism became the legitimating ideol-
ogy of the GDR and made the founding of the State and the leading role of the party 
in it appear the only alternative to fascism, and a historical necessity. The GDR claimed 
to stem solely from the progressive traditions of the German history and, through the 
turnaround in the years 1945-49, to have definitely put an end to any fascist tenden-
cies. The official version of its history, which blamed imperialism and capitalism for 
the appearance of Nazism, could be seen as relieving the people from guilt. What they 
had really done during the National-Socialist period was more and more forgotten. A 
more differentiated understanding of history could develop only from the 1970s 
onwards, when efforts were underway in the GDR aiming at contriving a broader 
historical basis for the "socialist German nation". Topics that had hitherto been 
neglected, such as the non-communist resistance against Hitler and the history of the 
German Jews, were now taken up. The anti-fascist founding legend, however, re-
mained untouched until the very end of the GDR. 


