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T H E C A S T L E O F E M P E R O R C H A R L E S IV I N L A U F : 

R E S I D E N C Y F O R A P R O J E C T E D N E W T E R R I T O R Y ? 

Barbara Schock-Werner 

The pretentious Castle which Emperor Charles IV had built in the Bavarian town of 
Lauf (also called "The Emperor's pleasure Chambers") is well-known, in the first place, 
because of its so-called arms hall: a room on the first floor which is entirely decorated 
with coats of arms of Bohemian families. The history of the Castle is - presumably 
because of this arms hall - well researched, but a detailed history of the construction 
process and an attempt at assigning it a proper place in the architecture of the period, 
are still missing. This is what the author attempts to fill in, one of her principál findings 
being far-reaching similarities with the architecture of the Parier family. This in turn 
sheds new light on the question what may have been the motivation for building such 
an ambitious complex. More than just a kind of road house on the way between Prague 
and Nuremberg - which is what it was hitherto understood to represent - the Castle 
seems to be intended as a representative residency for the Emperor who, just as the 
Castle was being built, was seeking to acquire and incorporate into his own lands the 
territory of the Zollern burgraves by way of carefully arranged marriages. Had he 
been successful, the Wenzel Castle in Lauf would have been, according to the author, 
the residential Castle for administering the new territory. 

A B R I E F H O N E Y M O O N I N 1 5 6 4 - 1 5 6 6 : 

T H E U T R A Q U I S T C O N S I S T O R Y A N D 

T H E A R C H B I S H O P O F P R A G U E 

Zdeněk V. David 

The problematic relationship between the Roman Church and the Utraquist Consis­
tory in the 1560s ultimately revolved around two issues: 1) While wishing the Roman 
Church to recognize the validity of communion sub utraque specie, the Utraquist 
Church was unable to acknowledge the permissibility of the communion sub una spe­
cie, or the right of the Curia or of Church Council to declare sub una valid in what was 
viewed as a contradiction of the unambiguous text of the Scripture; 2) While recogni-
zing for the Western Church (as distinct from the Eastern or Byzantine) a valid clerical 
Ordination only from canonically consecrated bishops in communion with the Roman 
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See, the Utraquist Church did not accept, in ecclesiastical matters, the legitimacy of 
any administrative or judicial authority outside of Bohemia, including that of the 
Curia or of the Church Councils. These complexities characterized the coexistence 
between the restored Roman Archbishop of Prague (1561) and the Consistory, in 
which the Utraquists still saw the ultimate judicial and administrative body of the 
Bohemian Utraquist Church. While by the late 1560s a few Czech theologians accept-
ed authentic Lutheranism, just as atypical Czechs championed the Counter Reforma­
tion, the mainstream of the Utraquist Church, in fact, continued on a steady course, 
the via media vis-ä-vis the Roman authoritarianism on the Right, and with respect to 
the Lutheran biblical reductionism on the Left. As a distinctive feature, this centrism 
lcnt an unusual tenor of open-mindedness to the discussions of theological and cccle-
siological issues. 

1 9 T H C E N T U R Y B O H E M I A N P A T R I O T 1 S M 

A N D S A I N T - R E N É T A I L L A N D I E R 

Pavla Horská 

This contribution by the well-known Prague historian Pavla Horská is based on the 
French Journal, Revue des deux mondes, where, in the years 1843-1879, the Paris-
based writer and literary historian Saint-René Taillandier (1817-1879) reported com-
prehensively on the cultural and political Situation of Central Europe. In these essays, 
the prominent admirer of and authority on German culture also dealt with Germany's 
eastern neighbours, thus becoming one of the first modern-time observers and ana-
lysts of nationally rooted confrontation in the Habsburg monarchy. The author of the 
present article examines how the Bohemian patriots and their autonomy aspirations 
fared in Taillandiers narrative and which differences, if any, can be found comparing 
the subsequent French, German, and Czech readings of these texts, concentrating on 
the especially pronounced differences in the interpretation of the socio-cultural struc­
ture of the patriotic strata of the Bohemian society in the late eighteenth and early 
nineteenth centuries. Horská singles out questions which ought to be posed by future 
historiography in order to utilize numerous sources which have so far been neglected, 
with the aim of solving the one question which has been controversially disputed ever 
since Taillandiers first articles, námely whether patriotic currents at that time were 
a kind of "renaissance", whether they signified the beginning of a new epoch, or 
whether, in the Bohemian lands just as elsewhere, continuitv was the hallmark of 
events. 

T H E I N T E L L E C T U A L C R I S I S : T H E D E B A T Ě A B O U T T H E 

R O L E O F C Z E C H I N T E L L E C T U A L S IN PŘÍTOMNOST 

J O U R N A L , 1 9 2 4 - 1 9 3 9 

Martina Winkler 

Not only did the First Czechoslovak Republic emerge in a period in which there 
existed heated argument about the role of the intellectuals throughout Europe; 


